
Joshua Antonio 
 
An experienced leader, Joshua has extensive experience in the education sector. He has 
worked 5 years for a Japanese ESL edu-tech start-up and 5 years with Zuitt, a coding school. 
During his work with Zuitt, he advocated for industry-based learning focused on providing 
learning sessions for the students to know more about their future careers and how to 
secure jobs within their target industry.  
 
In his 10 years of experience in recruitment and training for start-up companies, he has 
developed educational programs that bridge the gaps between academic learning and real-
world application. By fostering partnerships with industry experts, Joshua has created 
immersive learning experiences that equip students with the practical skills and 
knowledge they need to succeed in their chosen fields. 
 
Joshua draws from his 10 years in the education sector to champion better educational 
policies that puts the students first and foremost. Vote for Joshua to ensure you receive 
the quality education you deserve.  
 
Brison Chursinoff 
 
As a full-time student at Langara College for over two years, I have heard and understood 
concerns of my fellow classmates—who are as passionate about learning at the College as I 
am—regarding the transferability of courses into other post-secondary institutions and 
the importance of diverse assessment and evaluation opportunities beyond the traditional 
pencil-and-paper exams. 
 
As a student in the Department of Geography and Geology and Vice President of the newly 
formed Langara Geography and Urban Studies Club, I believe my experience in 
coordinating department-related events, communicating with instructors and department 
chairs regarding course offerings, and participating in my department’s Quality Assurance 
External Review has equipped me well to represent the student population in a diligent and 
well-informed manner. 
 
I believe students at Langara College deserve an Education Council student representative 
who understands and feels the importance and impact of diverse learning methods, as well 
as one who can relate to the struggle of finding out many of the unique and interesting 
courses Langara offers cannot fulfil prerequisite requirements for degrees at other post-
secondary institutions.  
 
Animesh Moudgil 
 
My name is Animesh Moudgil, and I’m running for student representative education 
council. Through my volunteer work on campus and experience giving orientations, I’ve 
had the privilege of helping many students navigate college life. These interactions have 
given me a deep understanding of our needs and the challenges we face. I also work off-
campus as a sales associate, where I’ve developed strong communication and time 
management skills, which will help me serve you effectively. 



 
If elected, I will advocate for initiatives that enhance student support, from academic 
resources to mental health services, and ensure our voices are heard in important decisions. 
I’m committed to creating a more inclusive and supportive environment for all students. I 
kindly ask for your vote to help make a positive impact on our campus. 
 
 


